Central

Ground House W.T. Seymour
Property Name Acres |Location/Description AAK Control J&M AA Lawn | Spouse }-D Lawncar{ Beck's Stevens & Sons Brantley SRB
Stevenson/5th Triangle 0.25|Small triangle at Stevenson and 5th Ave. || no bid $ 650($ 1800| % 1000|$ 1000|$ 2000($% 13.00|%$ 2500(% 10.00|% 14.00 no bid
Saginaw/3rd Triangle Small triangle at Saginaw St. &
0.1 |3rd Ave no bhid $ 650($%$ 1800|% 1000|$ 800|$ 1500|$ 13.00|$ 2500 % 400 |$ 10.00 no bid
Saginaw/King Triangle Small triangle at Saginaw St. &
0.1 |M.L.King Ave. no bhid $ 650($%$ 1800|% 1000|$ 800|$ 1000|$ 13.00|$% 2500 |$% 400 |$ 14.00 no bid
8th and 9th Street 2 corner Properties at 8th & 9th St.
corners & Triangles at Saginaw, triangle at 9th & Church,
2-triangles at 9th & Beach, triangle at
0.75 [9th St. & Grand Traverse no bid $ 1400|$ 1800($ 1200|% 1700|$ 2500($ 1400|$ 2800 (% 30.00|% 19.00 no hid
Gateway Triangles (3) triangle at E. Court and 5th St
(Gateway Sign), 2 triangles at
2 Lapeer & 5th St. no bid $ 3200|$ 3400|$ 7200|$% 3800|$% 5000|$% 2900|$% 5200 |$% 80.00|$ 39.00 no bhid
East Street Blvd Linear Park running from E. Court St
1.4 |to north of Second Street. no bid $ 2200|$ 2400|$ 4500 |% 2600|$% 4500|% 2000|$ 3500|$% 56.00% 29.00 no bhid
Stockton Park Small park at dead end of 3rd St. &
1.4 |Ann Arbor no bid $ 2200|$ 2400|$ 4500 |% 2600|$ 4500|% 2000|$ 3500|% 56.00% 29.00 no bid
Atwood Stadium Parkway outside of Atwood Stadium
1 at 3rd Ave and Begole no bid $ 1800|$ 1800[($ 3000|% 1800|$% 40.00($ 16.00|$ 28.00|$ 40.00|% 19.00 no bid
Commonwealth Triangle at Commonwealth &
Triangles (3) Montclair, triangle at Commonwealth
& Glendale, triangle at Greenfield &
1.5 |Commonwealth no bid $ 2500|$% 2500|$% 3500|% 2700|$ 4500|($ 2300|$ 3700]|%$ 60.00|% 34.00 no bhid
Longway Blvd & Medians of the center of center of
Triangles (3) Longway & south side of Longway from
Dort Hwy to Chavez, including triangle at
Horrigan Dr. & triangle at Chavez.
10 [Excluding triangle at Kearsley Street. $ 200.00 | $ 150.00 [$ 145.00 | $ 360.00 [ $ 155.00 |$ 250.00 | $ 149.00 |$ 236.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 174.00 no bhid
Longway Greenbelt Northside of R.T.. Longway from Willow
9.5 |[streetto Dort Hwy $ 180.00 | $ 140.00 [$ 13500 | $ 325.00 | $ 14500 |$ 250.00 | $ 139.00 |$ 190.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 149.00 no bhid
McFarlan Park Small park at M. L. King and
0.4 [Saginaw Street no bid $ 800|$ 1800|% 10.00|9$ 1100|$ 4000|9% 1300[($ 2500|% 36.00|$% 14.00 no bhid
Hamilton Park Small park at M. L. King and
0.15 [Fifth Ave no bid $ 650($%$ 1800|% 1000|$ 9.00|$ 2500|$% 11.00|$ 2500]% 6.00 [$ 14.00 no bhid
Burr Blvd Median from Lippincott to Pingree
15 no bid $ 2400|$% 2500|$% 3500|$% 2700|$ 6000[($% 2000|$% 3700|% 6000|% 29.00 no bid
Beach/Wellington/Church 3 small triangles at Beach &
0.1 |Wellington, Wellington & Church no bid $ 650($ 1800| % 1000|$ 80O0|$ 3000|%$ 11.00|$ 2500]% 400 |$ 14.00 no bid
12th Street west of Fenton Rd. mow
Cronin Derby Downs from school to woods, and 1-69 to 12th
10 |Street $ 175.00($ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 165.00 |$ 250.00 | $ 15400 ($ 236.00| $ 400.00 | $ 174.00 |$ 175.00
12th/Grand Traverse 4 triangles at 12th Street and
0.25 [Grand Traverse no bid $ 650($ 1800|$ 1000|$%$ 900|$ 3500($ 1200|%$ 2500]|% 10.00|%$ 19.00 no bid
Grand Traverse Triangle Triangle where Grand Traverse &
1 Church Street split no bid $ 1800|$% 1700|$ 1000|$ 1800|$ 4000|$% 1600|$ 28.00|$% 40.00|$ 29.00 no bhid
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