Northwest

Ground House 3-D W.T. Seymour
Property Name Acres [Location/Description AAK Control J&M AA Lawn Spouse Lawncare Beck's Stevens & Sons Brantley
Civic Park Triangles Triangles at Humbolt and Forest Hill,
0.25 |Jackson and Dartmouth no bid $ 650|$ 1800($ 10.00| % 9.00] $ 20.00 [ $ 13.00($ 25.00|$ 10.00|$ 14.00
Welch Blvd Median from M. L. King to Forest Hill
2 $ 10000|$ 3200|$% 3400|% 7200 8% 36.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 29.00| $ 52.00|$ 70.00|% 49.00
Triangle at Welch, Chevrolet &
Welch Triangles (2) 0.1 |Stockdale, Traingle at Welch & Dupont no bid $ 650|$ 1800($ 10.00| % 7.00| $ 20.00( $ 13.00($ 25.00|$ 6.00|9% 25.00
Dayton Blvd Median from Forest Hill to Proctor
2 $ 10000|$ 3400|$% 33.00|% 7200]|% 36.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 29.00| $ 52.00|$ 70.00|% 34.00
Dayton Triangles (2 2 Triangles at Delmar and Forest Hil
0.1 no bid $ 6.50($ 18.00|$ 10.00| % 7.00( % 20.00 | $ 13.00| $ 25.00| $ 6.00 | $ 14.00
Dougherty Park Small Park behind houses at Chevrolet,
1 Paterson and Stockdale no bid $ 1800($% 18.00|$ 4500 $ 18.00|$ 45.00( $ 1400 $ 25.00|$ 40.00| 9% 14.00
Chester Simmons Triangle Large Traingle/Median at M.L. King and
2 Pierson Road $ 10000|$ 3200|$% 33.00|% 7200]|% 36.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 29.00| $ 52.00|$ 70.00|% 49.00
East Lawn Triangles (2) 2 Triangles at Dartmouth and Lawndale
0.25 no bid $ 6.50($ 18.00| $ 10.00| % 9.00( % 20.00 | $ 13001 $ 25.00|$ 10.00|% 14.00
Forest Hill Blvd Median from Welch to Humbolt
2 $ 10000|$ 3400|$% 3300|% 7200]|% 36.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 29.00| $ 52.00|$ 70.00|% 49.00
Hamilton Blvd Median from Dupont to Forest Hill
3 $ 12000|$ 45.00|$ 43.00| $ 102.00| $ 53.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 39.00|$ 75.00|$ 90.00]|% 74.00
Wilkens Park Parkland at Verdun and York, excluding
1.7 |school property $ 9000|$ 2500|$% 2700|%$ 6500]|% 30.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 24001 $ 52.00|$ 68.00|% 45.00
Mackin/Dupont Triangle Triangle at Mackin, Dupont and Barth
0.1 no bid $ 6.50($ 18.00|$ 10.00| % 7.00( % 20.00 | $ 13.00| $ 25.00| $ 6.00 | $ 14.00
Della Triangle Triangle at Francis, Paterson and Oren
0.1 no bid $ 6.00($ 18.00|$ 10.00| % 7.00( % 20.00 | $ 13.00| $ 25.00| $ 6.00 | $ 14.00
Oren Triangle (2) 2 Triangles at Oren and M.L. King
0.1 no bid $ 6.50($ 18.00|$ 10.00| % 7.00( % 20.00 | $ 11.00| $ 2500 $ 6.00 | $ 14.00
Paterson Blvd Median from Forest Hill to Dupont
1 $ 9000|$ 18.00|$% 18.00|$ 45.00]| % 18.00 | $ 40.00 [ $ 1400|$ 28.00|$ 40.00| % 14.00
Dewey Park Park at Saginaw, Dewey and Moore,
4.5 |excluding Sylvester Broome Center $ 150.00| $ B80.00|$ 80.00|$ 144.00| $ 72.00($ 250.00| $ 99.00| $ 115.00|$ 140.00| $ 84.00
Chevrolet Blve Median from Dayton to Mackir
4 no bid $ 67.00[$% 65.00]|$ 14400]| % 67.00( $ 210.00| $ 64.00| $ 110.00|$ 130.00| % 74.00
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